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That being said The test that I did involved drawing an uneven pentagon The coordinates are shown above.. Opening the
Illustrator file using each artboard method gives me the same shape, but different coordinates.

- the app needs internet access so that it can download required contents (recitations, translations and Quran pages images)..
0000 l 317 0000 154 0000 l 312 5000 161 0000 l 309 0000 173 0000 l 307 5000 182 0000 l but as you can see from the
screenshot,the Y coordinates are not the same shown in the picture.. Ulasan: • Saya dah download aplikasi ni dan ia sangat bagus
• Aplikasi Quran ni dari hasil projek di King Saud Universiti.. 0000 l 321 5000 194 0000 l 330 5000 193 0000 l 335 0000 187
0000 l 337 0000 180 5000 l 340.

0000 274 0000 418 / 226 My canvas size in illustrator was 500 x 500 and my Raw illustrator bounding box was BoundingBox: 0
0 500 500 and AI3_Cropmarks: 0 0 500 500 (I guess that AI3 refers to the Legacy coordinates) Anyway, I don't have a direct
answer for you other than Illustrator's internal format does not translate directly to Photoshop's but I hope that this points
towards finding a solution.. 0000 450 0000 251 / 350 0000 94 / 1 150 0000 94 / 350 250 0000 100 0000 250 / 300 418.. I didn't
mean to offend Remember, we don't get paid for this, it is completely volunteer.. - the app needs to access to file storage so that
it can store downloaded contents (recitations, translations and Quran pages images).

Features: • Viewing scanned(soft) copy of real printed Mosshaf • Providing copy of Mosshaf Al-Madina, copy of Mosshaf Al-
Tajweed (colored according to Tajweed rules) and copy of Mosshaf Warsh (Rewayat Warsh An-Nafei').. I haven't had occasion
to export paths to files since upgrading to CS5 Now, when I open the exported AI paths file in Illustrator, I am met with a query
as to create an artboard for: a) Legacy Artboard b) Crop Area(s) c) Artwork Bounding Box or d) Page Tiles.. • Six Arabic
Tafsir(Commentary) 'Al-Saa'di, Ibn-Katheer, Al-Baghawy, Al-Qortoby, Al-Tabary and Al-Waseet'.. This is off by +400 points
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0000 174 0000 l 338 5000 165 5000 l 336 0000 159 0000 l 331 5000 153 0000 l 324 5000 150.. This indicates to me that the
coordinates that you find in the raw Illustrator file are relative to the crop area that is also recorded in the file.. However I was
able to somewhat duplicate what you got and confirm your findings In doing so, I was confronted by something that was also
new to me.. The Crop Area method however, translates the raw numbers in the AI file to my Photoshop coordinates.. Ye la flash
tu kan direct An easy way to compile and install GIMP and other great Free software on.. In the mean time, I'm trying to do my
'real' job with out getting in trouble with the boss.. Hello, I'm trying to save a path, made as polyline by mouse clicks using
Adobe Photoshop CS5.. As you can see, the first y coordinate is y=50 and was listed in the illustrator raw file as 450.. That
being said, a casual inspection does not reveal a DIRECT conversion For instance, like your example, my X coordinates were
correct, but in my experiment, my y coordinates were off by varying amounts.
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